
SPONSORSHIP OPPORTUNITIES
ALL NET PROCEEDS BENEFIT THE TAAHP SCHOLARSHIP FUND

Questions? Email katie@taahp.org

PRESENTING SPONSOR

$5,000 | EXCLUSIVE

Includes 12 players or guest passes, prominent 
display of company logo on promotional materials 
and at event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas 
Housing Conference websites.

LUNCH SPONSOR

$1,750 

Includes 4 players or guest passes, display of 
company logo on promotional materials and at 
event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

BEVERAGE SPONSOR

$1,500 

Includes 4 players or guest passes, display of 
company logo on promotional materials and at 
event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

GOODIE BAG SPONSOR

$1,250 

Includes 3 players or guest passes, display of 
company logo on promotional materials and at 
event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

SPECIAL GAME SPONSOR

$1,200 

Includes 2 players or guest passes, display of 
company logo on promotional materials and at 
event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

BUS SPONSOR

$750 

Includes 2 players or guest passes, display of 
company logo on promotional materials and at 
event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

SILENT AUCTION SPONSOR

$200 

Logo or name on flag at auction item hole, display of company logo on 
promotional materials and at event, recognition on TAAHP and Texas 

Housing Conference websites.

GOLF BAG SPONSOR

$500 

Includes 1 player or guest pass, display of company 
logo on promotional materials and at event, 
recognition on TAAHP and Texas Housing 
Conference websites.

AWARDS SPONSOR

$2,000 | EXCLUSIVE

Includes 6 players or guest passes, opportunity to 
present awards at event, display of company logo on 
promotional materials and at event, recognition on 
TAAHP and Texas Housing Conference websites.


